Sales Results — Oct. 25, 2015

ITOBA Sale, Indianapolis, IN

Hip Consignor Buyer Sales Price
1 Hart Well Farm Ron Brown $700.00
2 Allie Racing Stable Denny Anderson $600.00

3 Allie Racing Stable Travis Short $1,100.00
4 Hart Well Farm Denny Anderson $1,100.00
5 Hart Well Farm No bid

6 Breakway Farm,LLC Agent  Andrew Tumblin $900.00

7 Four Oaks Farm ouT

8 Elliott Farms, Agent Steve Fosdick $5,400.00
9 Elliott Farms, Agent ouT

10 Breakway Farm, LLC Gary Patrick $1,000.00
11 Elliott Farms, Agent Michelle Elliott $700.00
12 Stoney Creek Horse Farm RNA ($5,000.00)

13 Hart Well Farm No bid

14 Wright Road Stables Sam Musselman $500.00
15 Pat Haney NO BID

16 Plugin Away Acres NO BID

17 Plugin Away Acres NO BID

18 Four Oaks Farm ouT

19 Blaine Davidson RNA ($3,000.00)

20 Four Oaks Farm RNA ($2,200.00)

21 Elliott Farms, Agent Dwight Preston $1,100.00
22 Pat Haney Amy Elliott $500.00
23 Pat Haney Richard Batz $700.00
24 Four Oaks Farm ouT

25 Stoney Creek Horse Farm RNA ($14,500.00)

26 Justice Farm Gary Patrick $7,000.00
27 Justice Farm ouT

28 Elliott Farms, Agent Scotty Nicks $1,000.00
29 L. Michael Butler Denny Anderson $700.00
30 Justice Farm ouT

31 Justice Farm Julee Rodriguez $3,500.00
32 Pixie Dust Racing RNA ($2,000.00)

33 Plugin Away Acres No bid

34 Plugin Away Acres Lyle Garrity $800.00
35 Four Oaks Farm Blaine Davidson $7,500.00
36 Elliott Farms, Agent Mary Snodgrass $900.00
37 Pixie Dust Racing RNA ($4,500.00)

38 Breakway Farm, LLC Agent  RNA ($2,200.00)

39 Elliott Farms, Agent Darlene Green $500.00
40 Four Oaks Farm Gary Patrick $2,000.00
41 Pixie Dust Racing RNA ($13,000.00)

42 Breakway Farm, LLC Gary Patrick $500.00
43 Justice Farm Antonio Dwen $5,500.00



Sale Results, page 2

Hip Consignor Buyer Sales Price
44 Blaine Davidson RNA ($3,700.00)

45 Pine Tree T-Breds LLC RNA (S4,000.00)

46 Four Oaks Farm RNA ($3,000.00)

47 Blaine Davidson RNA ($3,700.00)

48 Hart Well Farm Andrew Tamblin $900.00
49 Hart Well Farm Ron Brown $500.00
50 Hart Well Farm No bid

51 Elliott Farms, Agent Gary Patrick $2,000.00
52 Blaine Davidson RNA ($3,500.00)

53 Justice Farm Gary Patrick $18,000.00
54 Justice Farm Gary Patrick $9,500.00
55 Four Oaks Farm Andrew Tamblin $2,500.00
56 Allie Racing Stable RNA ($3,500.00)

57 Bill Birkett Racing LLC Salvador Guerrero $600.00
58 West Farms Julee Rodriguez $3,200.00
59 Justice Farm Andrew Tamblin $9,000.00
60 Four Oaks Farm Darlene Green $3,800.00
61 Mapleton T-bred Farm Nicks Farm $1,000.00
62 R Star Farm Dwight Preston $1,500.00

#Sold35 # NotSold 21 #Out6 Sales Average $2,762



